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Senator Kunze

A   R E S O L U T I O N

Honoring Karissa Mitchell as a 2018 APBA National Champion

WHEREAS, The members of the Senate of the 132nd General 
Assembly of Ohio are pleased to pay tribute to Karissa Mitchell on 
placing first in the K PRO hydroplane category at the 2018 
American Power Boat Association National Championships; and

WHEREAS, This achievement is truly noteworthy, for Karissa 
Mitchell has clearly demonstrated her talent and perseverance, as 
well as her mental and physical fortitude as a junior hydroplane 
driver. The winner of this year’s K PRO hydroplane category at the 
American Power Boat Association National Championship, she has 
exemplified the courage, determination, and innate sense of the 
principles of good sportsmanship that are essential for success 
both in and out of the sports world; and

WHEREAS, In displaying such exceptional prowess, Karissa 
Mitchell has set an example worthy of emulation. Time and again, 
she has risen to the occasion, maintaining morale, composure, and 
tenacity that have earned her many admirers; and

WHEREAS, With competition playing such an important role in 
the total education of our young people, we are extremely pleased 
to recognize Karissa Mitchell on an exemplary year. Indeed, the 
same maturity and experience she has gained through her 
participation in sports will greatly aid her in meeting the 
challenges of the future; therefore be it

RESOLVED, That we, the members of the Senate of the 132nd 
General Assembly of Ohio, in adopting this Resolution, 
congratulate Karissa Mitchell on her remarkable attainment and 
extend best wishes for continued success; and be it further
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RESOLVED, That the Clerk of the Senate transmit a duly 
authenticated copy of this Resolution to Karissa Mitchell.
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