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Senator Gavarone

A   R E S O L U T I O N

Honoring Kaiyon McKinney as a 2019 OAC Junior High State 

Wrestling Champion.

WHEREAS, The members of the Senate of the 133rd General 
Assembly of Ohio are pleased to congratulate Kaiyon McKinney on 
winning the 2019 Ohio Athletic Committee Junior High State 
Wrestling Championship in the 78-pound weight class; and

WHEREAS, A sixth-grade student at Sandusky Middle School and 
a wrestler with the Burnett Trained Wrestling Academy, Kaiyon 
McKinney is deserving of great recognition for his exemplary 
accomplishment, for he placed first at this year’s OAC Junior High 
State Championship in the 78-pound weight class with a 5-0 
decision. His noteworthy record of personal achievement stands as 
a hallmark for others to emulate; and

WHEREAS, Through his outstanding efforts, Kaiyon McKinney has 
been an inspiration to many, and he has made his school, his 
coach, Erik Burnett, and his family very proud. His poise and 
precision have commanded widespread attention and respect, and 
thanks in part to his diligent practicing, he has been crowned a 
champion; and

WHEREAS, In a society that seeks to teach the next generation 
of leaders the fundamentals of self-reliance and the rewards of 
individual effort, athletic competition has become a valuable 
educational tool. With sports playing such an important part in 
the development of our young people, we are overjoyed to pay 
tribute to such a fine athlete as Kaiyon McKinney; therefore be it

RESOLVED, That we, the members of the Senate of the 133rd 
General Assembly of Ohio, in adopting this Resolution, salute 
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Kaiyon McKinney on his performance at the 2019 Ohio Athletic 
Committee Junior High State Wrestling Championship and extend best 
wishes for the years to come; and be it further

RESOLVED, That the Clerk of the Senate transmit a duly 
authenticated copy of this Resolution to Kaiyon McKinney.
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